BanN

FortCochin Branch
Amaravathy Jn
Ernakulam,Cochin - 682 001
PHONE: + 0484-2215840,2215840 , Fax No: + 0484-2217277

e-Mail: fortco@ucobank.co.in

Sale Notice (Sale through e-auction only Under SARFAESI Act 2002)

PUBLIC NOTICE FOR SALE OF ASSETS UNDER THE SECURITISATION AND
RECONSTRUCTION OF FINANCIAL ASSETS AND ENFORCEMENT OF
SECURITY INTEREST ACT 2002

Sale of immovable property mortgaged to Bank under Securitization &
Reconstruction of Financial assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act
2002

Whereas, the Authorised Officer of UCOBANK, FORT COCHIN BRANCH, Ernakulam had taken
possession of the following property pursuant to the notice issued under Section 13(2) of SARFAES|
ACT in the following loan account with right to sell the same strictly on “As is where is Basis” & “as is
what is basis” & whatever there is basis” & “Without recourse Basis” for realization of Bank's dues
plus interest as detailed hereunder and whereas consequent upon failure to repay the dues, the
undersigned in exercise of power conferred under section 13(4) of the Sarfaesi Act propose to
realize the Bank’s dues by sale of the said property. The Sale will be done by the undersigned
through e-auction platform provided at the website.

Name 8 Address of the Borrowers:(1). Mr.Antony Vinker.P.C S/o P.J Christopher of H No
11/358,Palliparambil house,K.B.Jacob Road,Cochin-1. (2) M/s Aba Cable TV Net wecrk,H No
11/538,Mulilavalappu,Cochin-1.

Name & Address of Guarantors: :{ 1) Mr.Ralph Liiyan S/o RobertH No 11/226, Naduvilaveettil,
Maradu, Cochin.{2) Mrs.Ninu Vinker W/o Antony Vinker,H No 11/356,Palliparambil House K.B.Jacob
Road,Cochin.

Date of Demand Notlce: 16/04/2015
Date of possession Notice: 07/08/2015

Amount due as per Demand Notice: Rs. 2266631.50 (Rupees Twenty two Lakhs Sixty six Thousand Six
hundred and Thirty one and Paise fifty only).

Amount paid subsequent to the demand notice; The party has paid a sum of Rs 390000/-(Rupees Three
lakhs ninety thousand only) on 13.06.2016, a sum of Rs 10000/- (Rupees ten thousand onlyjon
14.06.2016 and a sum of Rs150000/- { One Lakhs fifty Thousand onlyjon 30/06/2016.

Reserve price: Reserve Price for the property is Rs.9587000/- (Rupees Ninety Five lakhs eighty
Seven thousand only).

Earnest Money Deposit : Earmest Money Deposit for the e auction is Rs.958700/= ( Rupees Nine
Lakhs Fifty Eight Thousand Seven Hundred only).

Description of the immovable property Charged/Mortgaged and their Location. :

All that part and parcel of 2.41 Ares equivalent to 5.950 cents of land with a
residential building situate in Survey No.41/2 of Moolamkuzhi Muri,
Rameswaram Village, Cochin Taluk, Ernakulam District comprised in Sale Deed
No0.5982 /2003 dated 18.12.2003 in the name of Mr.Antony Vinker. P C, bounded
by (boundaries as per sale deed no 5982/2003).

Boundaries:
North: Property in Sy No 41/1,East : Property in Sy No 41/2and 18 links wide
pathway,South: Property in Sy No 41/2,West : Purambokku Kana
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20™ August 2016

.- DATE & TIME OF e-AUCTION SALE

between 12.00 Noon to 1.30 P.M

(with unlimited auto extensions of 5 minutes each, if required)
Last Date of Submission of Tender :: 26" August 2016 by 5 p.m.

Terms & Conditions:

1

2)

3)

4)

5)

€)

7

8)

9

Property is being sold on "As is and where is* & “ As is what is basis” & “Whatever there is
basis™ and “ without recourse basis”. intending bidders are advised to conduct search in
Revenue/SRO records to satisfy title, identity, extent, dimensions, survey number, door
number, boundaries or encumbrances in regard to the property proposed to be sold.
Intending Interested bidders to acces the portal/website of the e-auction Agency (viz.,
hitps://ucobank.auctiontiger.net

Bids should be submitted only ONLINE in the prescribed form. Online bids can be submitted
by accessing the website httgs:h’ucobank.auctiontiger.net Bids should be submitted
online on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26™ © August 2016.Separate bid should be submitted for
each item of property.

Bids should be submitted along with a copy of identity document as an attachment to the bid
form. Only copy of PAN Card, Passport, Voter's ID. Valid Driving License or Photo identity
card issued by Central/State Govt. shall be accepted as the identity document and should be
submitted along with the bid form. Bidders staying abroad/PIOs holding dual
citizenship/NRIs shall submit photo copy of his/her valid Indian Passport. Criginal Identity
document (copy of which is submitted along with the bid form) must be produced on
demand.

10% of the Upset Price/Reserve Price must be remitted towards EMD through
RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer to the Bank A/c No:16600210000878, IFSC NO:UCBA0001860
and the remittance details must be clearly indicated in the bid form. EMD amount remitted by
unsuccessful bidders shall be returned to them by the Bank without interest. In the event of
cancellation of auction also, EMD amount shall be returned by the Bank without interest.
Participating bidders are required to contact the Bank in this connection after the close of the
auction.

A copy of the bid form along with its enclosure(s) submitted online and duly signed
declaration shall be sent ‘o The Authorized Officer & Chief Manager, UCOBANK, Cochin-FB
No.281, Mattanchery, Cochin-2 so as to reach the same on or before 26"  August 2015.
The Bank shall not have any liability as regards delay in delivery/non-delivery of the bid form
and/or enclosures at the Bank by the Postal Authority/Courier Agency/Carrier, _
Incomplete bids, unsigned bids, as also bids not conforming to SL.Nos:3,4,5 and 6 above will
be summarily rejected. Bids which are not above the Upset Price shall also bs summarily
rejected. The Authorized Officer reserves absolute rights to accept or reject any one or more
bids or to postpone/cancel the Auction without assigning any reason.

Auction / bidding will be only through online e-bidding. Online bidding will commence from
the highest bid quoted among the bids and the minimum increase for each bid wiil be only
for Rs. 10,000/= _or multiples thereof for all items of properties.

In case of sole bidder, the bid amount quoted in his bid form must be improved by at least
one bid incremental value, lest the sale shall be cancelled/deferred. S

10) If any market-leading bid (bid higher than the highest at the point in time) is received within

the last five minutes of closing time, the bidding time will be extended automatically by
another five minutes. This process continues ill no bid comes for a period of five minutes
and the e-auction gets closed.

11) Highest bid will be provisionally accepted on “subject-to-approval” basis and the highest

bidder shall not have any rightitle over the property until the sale is confirmed in his favour.



12) Successful bidder shall remit 25% (Twenty five percentage ) of the bid amount (less EMD)
immediately on the sale being knocked down in his/her favour, through RTGS/NEFT, /Money
Transfer to the Bank A/c at SI.No.5. The Authorized Officer shall issue Sale Confirmation
Letter in favour of the successful bidder in due course. In case of pendency of any
Petition/Appeal, confirmation of sale shall be subject to the outcome of the Petition/Appeal.

13) The successful bidder shall remit the balance bid amount within 15 (Fifteen) days of
confirmation of sale in his favour. If the successful bidder fails to remit the balance bid
amount within the said period, the praperty shall be resold, in which case he shall forfeit the
amount already remitted by him. Also, he shall have no right or claim over the property or on
the amount for which the Property is subsequently sold.

14) Property can be inspected on 11" August 2016 between 10.00 am IST AND 05.00 pm IST
with prior appointment. Further property details, if any required, can be had from
Mr.Anoop.K.V ,Senior Manager, UCOBANK, FORTCOHIN, PIN:682001 PHONE: 0484
2215840

15) Two or more persons may join together in subm itting the bid, in which the Sale certificate will
be issued in their joint names only. No request for inclusion/substitution of names, other than
those mentioned in the bid, in the sale certificate will be entertained.

18) In case of more than one item of property brought for sale, the sale of properties will be as
per the convenience and it is not obligatory to go serially as mentioned in the sale notice.

17) All intimations to bidders/auction purchaser will be primarily through e-mail by the e-auction
service provider. Date of sending e-mail will be considered as date of intimation. If no
intimation reaches, bidders are expected to take efforts to find out status from the e-auction
service provider. Non receipt of intimation should not be an excuse for default/non payment

18) There shall be no fresh sale notice if the sale is postponed for a period less than 20 (Thirty)
days.

remitted by the successful bidder ,
20) Statutory dues/liabilities, etc., due to the Government/Local Body, if any, shall be borne by
the successful bidder. ‘
21) Successful bidder shall bear the charges/fee payable for registration of the property as per
law.
22) Bidders are advised to go through the service provider's portaliwebsite (viz.,

https:ﬁucobank.auctlontiger.net before participating in the auction. All participating
bidders shall be deemed to have read and understood the conditions of sale and be bound
by the conditions : '

23) Details regarding e-auctioning can be obtained also from the a-auction service provider, Viz.,

M/s. ABC Procure ,e-procure technologies Ltd., Ahmedabad. Contact Number : 079-

- 40230810/ 813 to 820 Moabile No. +91 9904587679/9686999578 Fax:- 07940016876,
e-mail id: stephen.kalpala@auctiontiger.net, support@auctiontiger.net

The auction sale is subject to confirmation of the secured creditor Bank.
Further inquiries, if any, in particular details of the property, verification of documerits and/or terms

and conditions of sale can be obtained from the Autharized Officer/Chief Manager; UCOBANK,
COCHIN,PB No .281 Mattanchery,Cochin-2, and Contact No:0484 2227288 during office hours,

PLACE: ERNAKULAM
DATE :13/07/2016
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| accoraingly:anected.

~  KOTTAYAM BRANCH
nucn BANK Cyrils Towers, Railway Station Road, Near’

PAE 3 Collectorate, Kottayam, Kerala-686 001,
o) .. SRR Ph: 0481-2585588, Fax: 2585599
T=HTA MR “““‘ Boionrs s Tuisl E- marl kottam@ucobank co. in

lon &
Ft_nammm_aummmgul of Security Interest Act 2002 -
Whereas the Authorised Off icer of UCOBANK, KOTTAYAM BRANCH, had taken passession of the following property pursuant
to the notice issued under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI ACT in the following loan-account with right to sell the same strictly
on “As is where is Basis” & “as is'what Is basis” & whatever there is basis” & “Without recourse Basis” for realization
of Bank’s dues plus interest as detailed hereunder and whsreas consequent upon failure to repay the dues, the undersigned
in exercise of power:conferred under section 13(4) of the: SARFAES| Act propose to realize the Bank's dues by sale.of the
said property The Sale will be done by the.undersigned through e-auction piatform provided at the website. -

Name & Address of the Borrowers:(1) Mr.Andrews C.Joy, Chirayil house, Olassa RO Kéttayam District-
686014 (2} Mrs.Jiji Andrews, Chirayil house Olassa P.O., Kottayam District-686014. 4

: Mr.Johnson_Varkey.M, Manakulathil Ebenezer Govt. HS Road,

Kudamaioorpo' Kottayam District-686017 Syons
"1 Date of Demand Notice: 30-04-2015 il Date of Possession: 11-01:2016

moun ;grrg §§ per demand notice: Rs.13; 64,533.49 (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Slxty Four Thousand Five
Hundred Thirty Three and paisa Forty Nine Only) and Rs.35, 333/- (Rupees Thirty Five Thousand Three
Hundred Thirty Three only) as on 30-04-2015 with further interest incidental expenses, costs, stc.to be charged
from 01-05-2015. {Present Book balance is Rs.12,20,866.77/- & 35,134 5(]/- with further interest |ncrdental

EXDERSES, mekzh he mgedﬁun01-05-2015}

Adl that pul allnm:ral dmmmkﬁ n OId Sy_N0283I1032 & 284!1 Re Sy Na 1&9{19
Block No.7 Am Village Kottayam Taluk, Kottayam District, Kottayam SRO standing inithe
name of M Joy compnised in Sale Deed No.1418/2005 dated 30-03-2005 registered with
Kottayam SRQ,M East: Propeddy of Sasikumar; South: Property of Sasr and’ Road West
Property of Sﬁ and Road; North: Property of Kesavan Nair.

Reserve Pnr:e Rs.32,23,000/- (Rupees Thirty two lakhs twenty three thousand only)

76) to contagt thie Bank in this connection after the close of the auction,

Eamest Maoney Deposit: Rs.3, 22,300/- (Rupees Three Lakhs Twenty Two thousand Three hundred only).

DATE & TIME OF €-AUCTION SALE: 29* August 2016 between 12.00 Noon to 1.30 PM
(with unlimited auto extensions of 5 minutes each, if required)
Last Date of Submission of Tender: 26™ August 2016 by 5 p. m.

Terms & andrtlons
1) Proper‘ry lis;being sold on “As is and where is" & * As is what is basrs" & “Whatever there is basrs" and “ without recourse
basis”. intending bidders are advised to conduct search in Revenue/SRO records to satisfy title, identity, extent, dimensions,
survey number, door number, boundaries or encumbrances in regard to the property. proposed to be sold
2) Intending Interested bidders to acces the portaliwebsite of the. e-auction Agency (viz., https/fwww.bank s.com
3) Bids should be submmed only ONLINE in the prescribed form. Online bids can be submitted by accessing the website
htips/hwvwe com. Bids shouid be submitied ordine on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26-08-2016. Separate
eni srmrs be amipd i'x gach fem of propeny.
Wmmamdmymasmmnmmmaiympym PAN Card,
: mmmmwmmwmm@awe
Wil e i foem. Blers staying abroad/PIOs holding dual citizenship/
Pum Onginal idensity document (copy of which is submitted along

7w e be o ms muxl

5} 0% of e Upset PriosFesene Price must be femisied iowards EMD through RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer t0 the Bank

. Alc No:'No:18420210000441, IFSC NO: UCBAD001842 and the remitiance details must be clearly indicated.irr the bid

. form, EMD amount remitted by unsuccessful bidders shall be retuned 1o them by the Bank without interest. In the event of
cancellation of auction also; EMD amount shall be returned by the Bank without interest: Pamcrpatmg bidders are required

A copy of the bid form alona’ with its Anclagiiralel aithmittad Anlina and Aok Aixnas daioasis o =



s

DIQ°SNOUID DB SUDIMILED 1T BaCN TR U1 propeny.
Bids should be, submifted along with a copy of. |dam|ty document as an attachment to the bid form. Only copy of PAN Card,
Voter's ID: Valid anng License or Photo identity card issued by Central/State Govt. shall be accepted as the
n:lern:%vcﬂ1 submitied along with the bid form. Bidders staying abroad/PIOs holding dual citizenship!
Mmﬂrﬂnﬁd Indian Passport. Original Identity document (copy of which is submitted along

I lnh‘ﬂhm}m be produced on demand.

5} 10% of the Upset P Price must be remitted towards EMD through RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer 10 the Bank | .
Alc No:'No:1842021 141, IFSC NO: UCBAO001842 and the remittance datails must be clearly indicated in the bid

4

A form, EMD amount remitied by unsuccessful bidders shall be retumed to them by the Bank without interest. In the event of

cancellation of auction alse; EMD amount shall.be retumed by the Bank without interest. Participating bidders are requnred

4 tocontact the Bank in this connection after the close of the auction.

6) A copy of the bid form along with its enclosure(s) submitted onling and duly 3|gned declaration shall be sent to The
Authorized Officer, UCO Bank, Zonal Office, 39/3720F, S R Complex, Ravipuram Road,Ernakulam, PIN-682016
so as 1o reach the same on or before 26" August 2016, The Bank shall not have-any liability as regards delay in delivery/
non-delivery of the bid form and/or enclosures at the Bank by the Postal Authority/Courier Agenicy/Carrier. !

which are not above the Upset Price shall also be summarily rejected. The Authorised Officer reserves absolute rights to
.. accept or reject any one or more bids or to postpone/cancel the Auction without assigning any reason.
8) Auction / biading will be only through online e-bidding. Online bidding will commence from the highest bid quoted among { . |
- the bids and the minimum increase for each bid will be-anly for Rs. 10,000/ or multiples thereof for all items of properties. | |1
8) In case of sole bidder, the bid amount quoted in his bid form must be improved by at least one bid mcremental value, lest
the sale shall be cancelled/deferred. -
10) If any market-leading bid (bid higher than the highest &t the pointin time) is received W|thm the last fnve m|nutes of closing
time, the bidding time will be extended automatically by another five m|nutes :This process continues till no’bid comes for
a penod of five minutes and the e-auction gels closed.
- 11) Highest bid will be provisionally accepted on “subject-lo-approval” bas1s and the hnghest bidder shall not have any right/
. fitle over the property until the sale is confirmed in his favour.
12) Successiul bidder shall remit 25% (Twenty five percentage ) of the bid .amount {less,EMD) immediately on the sale being

shall issue Sale Confirmation Letter in favour of the'successful bidder in due course. In case of pendency of any Petition/
Appeal, confirmation of sale shall be subjeet to the outcome of the Petition/Appeal.

13) The successiul bidder shall remit the balance bid amount within 15 (Fifteen) days of confirmation of sale in his favour. If the _
successful bidder fails o remit the balance bid amount within the said period, the property shall be resold, in which case | |
he shall forfeit the amountalmady ramitlacl byrf him 'Also, heshajl hax:e nmsght or dalrn er the | j he
for which the propeny is subsawxxﬂy * i s

14) Property can be inspecied on 18-08-3016 between 10. mmm’mm
property details, ifiany: required, can be had from Mrs. Asha M. Ku 8
PIN:686001, PHONE: 0481-2585599/2685588 - |

15) Two or more persons may join togsther in submitting the bid, in whlch the Sale certificate w:ll be issued in theu' joint names only.

%o No request for incluslon/substitution of names; other than those mentioned in the bid, in the sale certificate will be entertained.
5)

In case of mre than-ene item of property brought far sale, the sale of properties. will be as per the convenience and it
is not obligatory to go serially as mentioned. In-the sale notice.

17 All intimations fo bidders/auction purchaser will be primarily through e-mail by ihe e- -auction Service iprovider. Date of
. sending e-mallwill be considered as date of intimation: If no intimation reaches, bidders are expected to take efforts.to find
out status:from the e-auction service provider. Nor receipt of intimation should not be an excuse for defauib’non payment.

18) There shall be no fresh sale notice if the sale is postponed for a period less than 30 (Thirly) days.

19) Sale will not'be confirmed if the borrower tenders to' the Bank Contractual dues along with other expenses prior to the

©  Authorized Officer issuing Sale Confirmation: Letter to the successful bidder.-In such case the Bank. shall refund without
interest the: entire amount remitted by the successful bidder 5

20) Statutory duesfiabilities, etc., due to the Govemment/Local Body, if-any, shall:be bome by Ihe successful deder

21) Successiul bidder shall bear the chargesifee payable for registration of the property as per faw.. ;

Bidders are advised to go through the service provider's portaliwebsite {viz., ki
participating in the auction. Al pariicipating bidders shall be deemed to have read and upderstood the conditions of sale
and be bound by the conditionsDetalls regarding:e-auctioning can be obtained also.from the e-auction servica provider,
Viz. C1India Pvi Ltd,Address: Udyog Vihar, Phase-2, Gulf Petrochem Building,No.301, Gurgaon, HARYANA = 122015,
Help line numbers :91-124-4302020'/ 21 / 22 1 23 Help line. mobile numbers 91 729198 124/ 3
‘Email: balasubrahmany&m.b@cﬂndh.no :+01-3948041212/09001 B

The auction sale is subjeo% el erpdifon

Further inquiries, if any, iA:

can.be obtained from the Atno

PIN-682 016,Contact No:0484 - 235664ﬁ‘dunhg ci! -

Place : Ernakulam. 3

Date : 25-07-2016"

17) Incomplete bids, unsigned bids, as also bids not conforming.to SI.Nos:3,4,5 and 6 above will be summarily rejected. Bids |

knocked down in his/her favour, through RTGS/NEFT/Money Transfer to the Bank A/c af SI.No.5. The Authorized Officer |- 14




conditions of the g-auction sale are pub
www.statebankoftravancore.com
Sd/- Authorised Officer

2.www.tenders.gov.in, ;
Date: 25-07-2016 : i
Place: Alappuzha State Bank of Travancore

e

KOTTAYAM BRANCH
Cyrils Towers, Railway Station Road, Near
Collectorate, Kottayam, Kerala-686 001,
Ph: 0481-2585588, Fax: 2585599
E-mail: kottam@ucobank.co.in
-auction only Under SARFAES! Act 2002

TISATION AND NSTRUCTION OF Fi

{CE FOR SALE OF SETSUN Hi i)
ENFORCEMENT OF SECURITY INTEREST ACT 2002
Sale of immovable property mortgaged 10 Bank under Securitization & Reconstruction of
Financial assets and Enforcement of Security interest Act 2002

Whereas, the Autrorised Officer of UCOBANK, KOTTAYAM BRANCH, had taken possession of the following property pursuant
0 the notice issued under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI ACT In ihe following loan account with right to sell the same strictly
on “As is where 1 Basis" & “asis what is basis” & whatever there is pasis” & “Without recourse Basis” fof realizaticn
of Bank's dues plus interest a8 getalled hereunder and whereas consequent'upan failure.to repay the dues, the undersigned

- et conierred padersecion 13(4) aithe SARFAESIACt propose 1o reglize the Bank's dues by sale of the

The salg snan ow SuLT= e . .
lished in the’ following WeDst I

i
ohon pianem prondes 2 e websile

in expipse B
= hpety B Sz wil oF 3002 by né yridersiged Msa” g-aulid O
arambil HOUSE, Cheepunkal P

- Kamalasanan P.K., Puthenp

Date of Possession: 13-01 2016
Four Lakh Sixty Four Thousand Four Hundred
Fifty Two Thousand Three
2 of interest, and incidental
63,653.58 & Nil with further

d

Kottayam District-p86563
Date of Demand Notice:
M Res.4,64,436.22 (Rupees
Thirty Six and paisa Twenty Two Only) and Rs.1,52,362.88 (Rupees One Lakh
Hundred Sixty Two and paisa Eighty Eight only) @s on 22-09—2015{axdusiv
expenses. (oSS B pe charged from 2%.09-2015) Present Book balance 1S Rs.4.
~orest noCENE excenses Ccosts &2 0 pe charged from 23-08-2015

cripti f immova
v that pant and parce! of land admeasunn

c ed and their LO i
A g 1545 Ares Old 5y.N0.525!1A, Re.Sy,No.MOfS. Block No.9
situate at Aymanam Village. Kottayam Taluk. Kotiayam District, Kottayam SRO slanding in the name of
Mr.Kamalasanan p.K. comprised In Sale Deed No.1416/74 dated 04-05-1974 registered with Kottayam
SRO. Boundaries: East; Property of Kamalasanam south: Property of Kamalasanan, West: Foot path,

North: Road.

Reserve Price: Rs.20,00,000/- (Rupees Twenty Lakhs only)
_ B Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.2,00,000/- (Rupees Two lakhs Only
= DATE & TIME OF g-AUCTION SALE: 29" August 2016 between 12.00 Noon to 1.30 PM

{(with unlimited auto extensions of 5 minutes each, if required}
Last Date of Submission of Tender: 26" August 2016 by 5 p-m-

e



suryey number, 0007 -
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2] Intgniding Inerested bidders 10 acces the poriatwebsite of (he &-auctian Agency (viz., hitps/www.bankeauctions.com

3) Bids shouid be submitted only ONLINE in ihe prescribed form. Online bids can be submitted by accessing the website
https//www.bankeauctions.com. Bids should be submitted oniine on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26-08-2016. Separate
bid should be submitted for each item of property.

4) Bids should be submitted along with a copy of identity document as an attachment to the bid form. Only copy of PAN Card,
Passport, Voter's 1D. Valid Driving License or Photo identity card issued by Central/State Govt. shall be accepted as the
identity document and should be submitied along with the bid form. Bidders staying abroad/P10s holding dual citizenship/
NRIs shail submit photo copy of his/her valid Indian Passport. Original identity document (copy of which is submitted along
with the bid form) must be produced on demand. i

5) 10% of the Upsel Price/Reserve Price must be remitted towards EMD through RTGS/NEFT/Maney transter to the Bank

I 7|™ Al No: No:18420210000441, IFSC NO: UCBAQ001842 and the remitiance details must be clearly indicated in the bid
form. EMD amount remitted bhunsuccessful bidders shall be returned to them by the Bank without interest. In the event of
cancellation of auction also, EMD amount shall be returned by ihe Bank without interest, Participating bidders are required
o cantact the Bank in this connection after the close of the auction.

6) A copy of the bid form along with its enclosura(s) submitted online and duly signed declaration shall be sent to The
Authorized Officer, UCO Bank, Zonal Office, 39/3720F, S R Complex, Ravipuram Road,Ernakulam, PIN-682016
<o as 1o reach the same on or before 26* August 2016. The Bank shall not have any liability as regards defay in delivery/
non-delivery of the bid form and/or enclosures at the Bank by the Postal Authority/Courier Agency/Carrier.

7) Incompieie bids. unsigred Dics, @s also bids not conforming to SI.Nos:3.4,5 and 6 above will be summarily rejected. Bids
which are not above the Upsat Price shall also be summarly rejected, The Authorised Officer reserves absolute rights to
accept or reject any one or more Dids or 10 postpone/cancel the Auction without assigning any reason.

8) Auctior / bioding will be only thraugh online e-bidding. Online bidding will commence from the highest bid quoted among
ihe bids and the minimum increase for each bid will be only for Rs. 10,000/~ or multiples thereof for all items of properties.

9) Incase of sole bidder, the bid amount quoted in his bid form must be improved by at least one bid incremental value, lest
the sale shall be cancelled/deferred. _

10) If any market-leading bid (bid higher than ne highest at the point in time) is received within the last five minutes of closing
fime, the bidding time will be extended automatically bdv another five minutes. This process continues till no bid comes for
a period of five minutes and the e-aliction gets closed.

11) Highest bid will be provisionally accepted on "subject-to-approval” basis and the highest bidder shall not have any right/
titie over the property until the sale is confirmed in his favour,

12) Succeseful bidder shall remit 25% (Twent['yi five percentage ) of the bid amount (less EMD) immediately on the sale being
knocked down in hisher favour, through RTG NEFT/Money Transfer to the Bank A/ at SINo.5. The Authorized Officer
shall issue Sale Confirmation Letter in favour of the successiul bidder in due course, In case of pendency of any Petition/
Appeal, confirmation of sale shall be subject to the outcome of the Petition/Appeal.

13) The successful bidder shall remit the balance bid amount within 15 (Fifteen) days of confirmation of sale in his favour. if the
successful bidder fails to remit the balance bid amount within the said periad, the property shall be resold, in which case
he shall foreit the amount already rerritted by him. Also, he shall hiave no right or claim over the property or on the amount
for which the property Is subsequently sold.

14) Property can be inspected on 18 -08-2016 between 10.00 am IST AND 05.00 pm IST with prior appointment. Further
property details, if any required, can be had from Mrs. Asha M. Kumaran, Manager, UCOBANK, Kottayam,

1| PIN:686001, PHONE: 0481-2585599/2585588

& | 15) Two or more persons may join together in submitting the bid, in which the Sale cerficate will be issued in their joint names onty.
No requast for inclusion/substitution of names, other than those mentioned in the bid, in the sale certificate will be entertained.

16) In case of more than one item of property brought for sale, the sale of properties will be as per the convenience and it
is not obligatory o go serially as mentioned in the sale notice.

17 Al intimations to bidders/auction purchaser will.be.g a1

T 3755 o ot el 2
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s _‘_@-ﬁ‘ -aaa.uco BANK Cyrils Towers, Railway Station Road, Near
(Mrrecr weeat 1 Ta) A Gov. of india Unsertaxing) Collectorate, Kotiayam, Kerala-686 001,

Ph: 0481-2585588, Fax: 2585599

E-mail: kottam@ucobank.co.in

Tt JToE LA Hunwus Your Tied

SALE NOTICE (Sale through e-auction only Under SARFAESI Act 2002)
B E LE OF ASSETS UNDER SATION N OF FINANCIAL A

Financia els a = E eresi ACL cUVe
Whereas, the Authorised Officer of UCOBANK, KOTTAYAM BRANCH, had taken possession of the following property pursuant
o the notice issued under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI ACT in the following loan account with right to sell the same strictly
on “As is where is Basis” & “as is what is basis” & whatever there is basis” & “Without recourse Basis" for realization
of Bank's dues plus interest as detailed hereunder and whereas consequent upon failure to repay the dues, the undersigned
in exercise of power conferred under section 13(4) of the SARFAESI Act propose to realize the Bank's dues by sale of the
said property. The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website.

Name & Address of the Borrowers: Mr.P.M. Jacob, Proprietor; Perumacheril Industries (S/o P.I. Markose),
Perumacheril House, Near Gomathy junction, Chingavanam PO, Kottayam-686531

Latest available address: P.M.Jacob,S/o P.l. Markose, Bright Tourist Home, Puthenchantha, M.G. Road,
Trivandrum-695001.

1] Chingavanam P.O., Kottayam-686531.

rantofs::George Jacob, Perumacheril House, Near ‘Gomathy Junction,

Date of Demand.Natice: 01-11-2012 { Date of Possession: 11-03-2014
ﬂmmpﬂg_emﬁum Rs.32,04,904.68 (RupeesThirty Two Lakhs Four Thousand Nine

Hundred and Four and Paise Sixty Eight Only) including interest upto 30-06-2012 with further interest
,costs, incidental expenses etc. to be charged from 01-07-2012. g

c ption of the Immovable svable propertie arged/Mortqaged and their Loca

(1) All that part and parcel of the properties 1) An Area of land admeasuring 10.40 ares of land and factory
puiding in Old Sy. No.300/15/2, Re.Sy. N0.323/23, Block No.19 of Nattakom Village, Kottayam Taluk,
Kottayam District, Kottayam SRO. Boundaries: East: Property belonging to Vathakkadan; South: Properties
belonging to Mannoopparambu and Poothara; West; Purayidam belonging to Onattuthazhchayil; North:
Properties belonging to Onadan and poothara; _ ) ey )

(2) All stocks of Raw materials and finished goods of automobile components and spares-etc. in the
premises of M/s perumacheril Industries, Near Gomathy Junction, Chingavanam, Kottayam-686531.

Reserve Price: Rs.72, 26,000/ (Rupees Seventy Two Lakhs Twenty. Six Thousand Only)

Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.7,22,600/- (Rupees Seven Lahks Twenty Two Thousand Six Hundred only)

DA g OF e-A 0 A Oth Aug 010 be e1s 0( 00 0 D P

Terms & Conditions: :

1) Property s being sold on “As is and where is” & * As is what i basis” & “Whatever there is basis” and “ without recourse
basis’. Intending bidders are advised to concuct search in Revenue/SRO records to satisfy title, identity, extent, dimensions,
survey number, door number, boundaries or encumbrances in regard to the property proposed to be sold.

2) Intending Interested bidders fo acees the portaliwebsite of the g-auction Agency (viz., https/iwww.bankeauctions.com

3) Bids shous e submitted only ONLINE in the prescribed form. Online bids can be submitted by accessing the website

E sl eauctions.com. Bids should bersubmitted online on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26-08-2016. Separate
bid shouid be suomitied for each item of property. -

4) Bids shoud be submitted along with & copy of identity document as an attachment to the bid form. Only copy of PAN Card,
Passport. Vor's 0. Valid Driving License o Photo identity card issued by Central/State Govi. shall be accepied as lhe
identity documess and should be submitted along with the bid form. Bidders staying abroad/PIOs holding dual citizenship/
NRIs shal sutmiz photo copy of his/her valid Indian Passport. Original Identity document (copy of which is submitted along
with the big fomm} must be produced on demand. ;

5) 10% of the Upses Price/Reserve Price must be remitted towards EMD through RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer to the Bank
Ac No: No:18£20210000441, IFSC NO: UCBA0001842 and the remittance details must be clearly Indicated in the bid
form. EMD @t smitied by unsuccessful bidders shall be retumed to them by the Bank without interest. In the event of
cancellation of zucion 20, EMD amount shall be retumed by the Bank without interest. Participating bidders are required

" 4o contact the Bamk i s connection after the close of the auction, : .
6) A copy of the bid S along with fts enclosura(s) submitted online. and duly signed declaration shall be sent to The

Authorized Oficse. UCO Bank, Zonal i?tﬂce, 39/3720F, S R Complex, Ravipuram Road,Ernakulam, PIN-682016

T D e e aibataus Anh Aimand ANAE Tha Danl bl nat hava ams liahilihe ae ranarde dalovin Aaliviand/
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sy s, LI NUMDEN, DOUNdanes or encumbrances in regard to the property proposed to be sold.

) Iriending Inerested bidders to acces Ihe portaliwebsite of the e-auction Agency (viz., i U

} Baos should be submitied only ONLINE In the prescribed form. Online bids can be submitted by accessing the website

bittps//www.bankeauctions.com. Bids should be submitted online on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26-08-2016. Separate

bid should be submitted for each item of property. :

) Bids should be submitted along with a copy of identity document as an attachment to the bid form. Only copy of PAN Card,

Passport, Voler's ID. Valid Driving License'or Photo identity card issued by Central/State Govt. shall be accepled as the

identity document and should be submitted along with the bid form. Bidders staying abroad/PIOs holding dual citizenship/

NRIs shall submit photo copy of his/her valid Indian Passport. Original Identity document (copy of which is submitied along

with the bid form) must be produced on demand. -

10% of the Upsat: Price/Reserve Price must be remitted towards EMD through RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer to the Bank

Alc No: No:18420210000441, IFSC NO: UCBA0001842 and the remitiance details must be clearly indicated in the bid

form. EMD amount remitted by unsuccessful bidders shall be retured to them by the Bank without interest. In the avent of

cancellation of auction also, EMD amount shall be returned by the Bank without interest. Participating bidders are required

to contact the Bank in this connection after the close of the auction.

6) A copy of the bid form aleng with its 6n0|0$_ii_f:€3{§}asumiﬂ§d online. and duly signed declaration shall be sent to The

Authorized Officer, UCO Bank, Zonal Office, 720F, S R Complex, Ravipuram Road,Ernakulam, PIN-682016

s0 as to reach the same on or before 26" August 2016, fh'a- Bank shall not have any liability as regards delay in delivery/

non-delivery of the bid form and/or enclosures at the:Bank by the Postal Authority/Courier Agency/Carrier,

7) Incomplete bids, unsigned bids, as also bids not conforming to Sl.Nos:3,4,5 and 6 above will be summarily rejected. Bids

which are not above the Upset Price shall also be summarily rejected. The Authiorised Officer reserves absolute rights to

accept or reject any one or more bids or to postpane/cancel the Auction without assigning any reason,

Auction / biading will be only through online e-biading. Oniine bidding will commence from the highest bid quoted among

the bids and the minimum increase for each bid will be only for Rs. 10,000~ or multiples thereof for all items of properties.

8) In case of sole bidder, the bid amount quoted in' his bid form must be improved by at least one bid incremental value, lest

the sale shall be cancelled/deferred.

10) If any manest-isading bid (bid higher than the highest at the paint in time} is received within the last five minutes of closing

time, the bexing tme will be extended automatically by another five minutes. This- process continues till no bid comes for

a period of e minules and the e-auction gets closed, : iy

11) Highest be sl be prowsionally accepted on “subject-to-approval” basis and the highest bidder shall not have any right

litle over T zroperty undl the sale is confirmed in his favour. i :

12) Successtd Sarier shal remit 25% (Twenty five percentage ) of the bid amount (less EMD) immediately on the sale being
knockec amwm in Pister favour, (hrough RTGS/NEFT/Money Transfer to the Bank A/c at SI.No.5, The Authorized Officer

- shall issue Sate Confirmation Letter in favour of the successful bidder in due course. In case of pendency of any Petition/

. Appeal. comsmaticn of sale shall be subject to the outcome of the Petition/Appeal.

13) The sucosssis Sener siall remit the balance bid amount within 15 (Fifteen) days of confirmation of sale in his favour. If the

successiy e =is  remit the balance bid amount within the said period, the property shall be'resold, in which case

he shal st ibe smown already remitted by him. Also, he shall have no right or claim over the property or on the amount

for whioh e ey ssnm%c
14)  Propes mepected on 19 between 10.00 am IST AND 05.00 pm IST with prior?aﬁpoimmnt. Further
WM" M. Asha M. Kumaran, Manager, UCOBANK, Kottayam,

o
—_

: imwms'MaﬂuMhMMWgw

No e 15 I MSESnn S oF TS, IIE TET PSSR TETIOTEC FTE 3C ¢ Pe s3E cericate will be entertained.

16) In Casse: v v T WHE =N I DApEty ST T SiE S SHe O Dapetes will 3= 35 2erie convenBnce and
is not Eoiigsmy o g SEvEly &= MEMOTED £ TE S36 WECE -

17 All inSrssines & s pucreser Wil be primadly frough s-mail Dy e e-auction sefvice provider. Date of

senging sl will 22 consicerss 25 date of infmation. I no inumation reaches, bidders are expected to take efforts to find |

out SEE T e S-3uction service provider. Non receipt of intimation should not be an excuse for default/non payment,

18) These small = mo r=sh sale notice ff the sale is postponed for a period less than 30 {Thirty) days:

19) Salewll mun %% czwirmed if the borrower tenders 1o the Bank Contractual dues along with other expenses prior to the
Autmeessts s =sung Sale Confirmation Leier Lo the successful bidder. In such case, the Bank shall refund without
intes=s il @mownt remitied by the successful bidder S Lo

20) Stz ussliEniEss. ec., due to the Govemment/ ocal Body, if any, shall be bome by the successful bidder.

21) Sucossaly) mumie ==l Dear the chargesfiee payabie. for registration of the property as per law. I
Bidoes e @Es © go trough the senvice provider's portal/website (viz., https//www.bankeauctions.com before |-
paricgliiy i @uien. Al participafing biciders shall be deemed 1o have read and understoed the conditions of sale
and &= i e cordisonsDetalls regasting e-auchioning can be:oblained also from-the. e-auction service provider, |
Viz, ChimiliriEan Adress: Udyog Vihar, Pzse-2, Gulf Petrochem Building, No.301, Gurgacn, HARYANA - 122015,

T 31-124—43?6?020 | 21 1 22 | 23 Help line mf?;t;/ numbers : 91-7291981124 / 1125 / 1126
: i mb@cl indl:c-.um_ 1212/9800123425, hitps//www.bankeauctions.com
of e gy, vesiication of documents and/or terms and nditions - of sl
Zomat Office 39/3720F SR Complex, Ravipuram Road Eesdkuta

64 1durmg efice nours RIS SR 3
s (Sd/-) Authorised Officer, | |
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second half of 2014. On 07 December That a fall is there to be taken comes  wuinox
2014, WADA wrote to Dr. Rodchenkov ~ down, comically, to WADA finally itdoes.

KOTTAYAM BRANCH

Cyrils Towers, Railway Station Road, Near
Collectorate, Kottayam, Kerala-686 001,

Ph: 0481-2585588, Fax: 2585599

E-mail: Kkottam@ucobank.co.in

SARFAESI Act 2002)

SALE NOTICE (Sale through e-auction only Under
' [ FUBLIC NOTICE FOR SALE OF ASSETS UNDER THE SECURITISATION AND RECONSTRUCTION OF FINANCIAL ASSETS A

B EFORSALEOFA

E&EQBQE&EE&ESEQQBMMEBEIAQHWE

lgage Bank ur ecuritization & Reconstru ion of
of Security Interest A 2

Whereas, the Authorised Officer of UCOBANK, KOTTAYAM BRANCH, had taken possession of the following propetty purs

o the notice issued under Section 13(2) of SARFAES! ACT in the following loan account with right to sell the same st

o0 “As is where Is Basis” & “asis what is basis” & whatever there is basis” & “Without recourse Basis” for realiz

of Bank's dues plus interest as detailed hereunder and whereas consequent upon failure to repay ine dues, the undersi

in exercise of power conferred under section 13(4) of the QARFAES! Act propose to realize the Bank's dues by sale €

said property. The Sale vill be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website.

: {1) Mrs. Begum Suni Afsal, W/ o C.M. Afsal, Kochukaniyamku

Mariyathuruthu P 0, Kottayam,686027. (2) Mr.C.M. Afsal, Kochukaniyamkulam, Mariyathuruthu |

| Kottayam-686027.
Date of Demand Notice:

ncial

31-10-2013 | Date of Possession: 11-03-2014
ice: Rs.7,66,492/- (Rupees Seven Lakhs Sixty Six thousand

Hundred Ninety Two Only) as on 01-10-2013 and interest thereon with incidental expenses, costs etc
charged from 01 -10-2013.Present book balance is Rs.5, 27,587/-and interest, incidental expenses, cost

to be charged from 01-10-2013.

h

De ; the able es Charged/Mortaaged a eir Location
An area of land admeasuring 1/15 undivided right owner of 03.23 Ares of Land in Old Sy No.33/13, R
No. 19, Block No 87 of Kottayam Village, Kottayam Taluk, Kottayam SRO Owned by Mrs. Suni

Vadakkekutiu, Aymanam Viliage, Kottayam. ries: East: Srinivasa lyer Road; South: Prope
Madhavikutty Amma; West: Property belonging to Nedumangattu; North: Property of Gopalakr

Menon of Sivakripa.
Reserve Price: Rs.11,68,000/- (Rupees Eleven Lakhs Sixty Eight Thousand only)

Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.1,1 6,800/- (Rupees One Lakh Sixteen Thousand Eight Hundred Onl

DATE & TIME OF €-AUCTION SALE:; 29 August 2016 between 12.00 Noon t01.30 P
(with untimited auto extensions of 5 minutes each, if requirer
ission of Tender: 26™ August 2016 by 5

Last Date of Sub
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SuUTvEy Numbel, 00O NUMDer, DOUNCaes Of encuTbrances N regard 10 e propeny pronosed fo be soid.

2} intending Interested bidders to acces the portaliwebsite of the e-auction Agency (viz.. hitps/iwww.bankeauctions.com{ |

3) "Bids shouid be submitted only ONLINE in the prescried form. Online bids can be submitied by accessing the websile |
hitps/iwww. ons.com. Bids should be submitted online on or before 5.00 pm IST on 26-08-2016. Separate
bid should be submitted for each item of property. )

4) Bids should be submitied along with & copy of identity document as an attachment to the bid form, Only copy of PAN Card,
Passport, Voter's ID. Valid Driving License or Photo identity card issued by Central/State Gowt. shall be accepted as the
identity document and should be submitted along with the bid form. Bidders staying abread/PIOs holding dual citizenship/
NRIs shall submit photo copy of hisier valid Incian Passport. Original Identity document {capy of which is submitted along
with the bid form) must be preduced on demand.

5) 10% of the Upset Price/Reserve Price must be remitted towards EMD thiough RTGS/NEFT/Money transfer to the Bank
Ale No: No:18420210000441, IFSC NO: UCBA0001842 and the remittance details must be clearly indicated in the bid
form. EMD amount remitted by unsuccessfut bidders shall be returned to them by the Bank without interest. In the event of
canceliation of auction also, EMD amount shall be returned by the Bank without interest, Participating bidders are requirad
to contact the Bank in this connection after the close of the auction. '

6) A copy of the bid form along with its enclosure(s) submitted online and duly signed declaration shall be sent fo The
Authorized Officer, UCO Bank, Zonal Office, 39/3720F, 8 R Complex, Ravipuram Road,Ernakulam, PIN-682016
s0 as to reach the same on or before 26™ August 2016. The Bank shall not have any liability as regards delay in delivery/
non-delivery of the bid form and/or enclosures at the Bank by the Postal Authority/Courier Agency/Carrier.

7) Incomplete bids, unsigned bids, as also bids not conforming to SI.Nos:34,5 and 6 above wil be summarily rejected. Bids
which are not above the Upset Price shall also be summarly refected. The Authorised Officer reserves absoiute fights 1o
accept or reject any one or rore bids or to postpone/cancel the Auction without assigning any feason.

8) Auction / bidding will be only through online e-bidding. Online bidding will commence irom the highest bid quoted among
the bids and the minimum increase for each bid will be only for Rs. 10,000/ or multiples thereof for alf items of properties.

9) In case of sole bidder, the bid amount quoted in his bid form must be improved by at least one bid incremental value, fest
the sale shall be cancelled/deferred.

10} If any marketleading bid (bid higher than the highest al the point in time) is received within the last five minutes of closing
fime, the bidding time will be exlended automatically by another five minutes. This process continues til no bid cores for

& period of five minutes and the e-auction gets closed, i

11) Highest bid will be provisionally accepted on “subject-to-approval” basis and the highest bidder shall not have any right/
title over the property until the sale is confirmed in his favour.

12} Successful hidder shall remit 26% (Twenty fwasjnercentage } of the bid amount (less EMD) immediately on the sale being
knacked down in histher favour, through RTGS/NEFT/Money Transfer to the Bank Alc at SLNo.5. The Authorized Officer
shall issue Sale Confirmation Letter in favour of the successful bidder in due course. In case of pendency of any Petition/
Appeai, confirmation of sale shall be subject to the outcome of the Petition/Appeal. E

13) The successful bidder shail remit the balance bid amount within 15 (Fifteen) days of confirmalion of sale in his favour. If the
successiul bidder fails to remit the batance bid amount within the said period, the praperty shall be resold, in which case
he shall forfeit the amount already reritied by him. Also, he shall have no right or claim over the property or on the amount
for which the propery is subsequently sold.

14) Property can be inspected on 20-08-2016 between 10,00 am IST AND 08.00 pm IST with prior appointment. Further
property details, If any required, can be had from Mrs, Asha M. Kumaran, Manager, UCOBANK, Kottayam,
PIN:686001, PHONE: 0481-25855809/2585588

15) Two or more persons may join together in submitting the bid, in which the Sale cerl

No raquest for inclusion/substitution of names, other than those mentioned o the.bic

in case of more than one its: Rt TG - e I
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